To be completed, signed and returned with Bid.

BID PRICING SHEET

Company: Everon, LLC

Pricing Sheet - Table 1 - Fire Alarm Inspection, Testing & Reporting

# | Estimated Year 1 Year1 Year 2 Year 2
Quantity Item Unit Extended Unit Extended
Price Price
1 1 | Annual Fire Alarm
System Testing & | $3,600.00( $3,600.00 | $3,960.00] $3,960.00
Inspection - MHS
2 1 | Annual Fire Alarm
System Testing & $1,725.00| $1,725.00 | $1,897.50| $1,897.50
Inspection - MES
3 1 | Annual Fire Alarm
System Testing &  [$4,500.00 | $4,500.00 |$4,950.00| $4,950.00
Inspection - JFC
4 1 | Annual Fire Alarm
System Testing & | $1,950.00 $1,950.00 | $2,145.00| $2,145.00
Inspection - RDS
5 1 | Annual Fire Alarm
System Testing & $1,350.00| $1,350.00 |$1,485.00 | $1,485.00
Inspection - ARS
Total Fire Alarm 413 175 00|$13,125.00 [$14,437.50 $14,437.50
Inspection Fees
Pricing Sheet - Table 2 — Sprinkler Systems Inspection
# | Estimated Year1l Year1 Year 2 Year 2
Quantity Item Unit Extended Unit Extended
Price Price
6 4 | Quarterly Sprinkler
System Testing & | $525.00 |$2,100.00 |$577.50 [ $2,310.00
Inspection - MHS
7 4 | Quarterly Sprinkler
System Testing & | $525.00 |$2,100.00 |$577.50 |$2,310.00
Inspection - JFC
8 4 | Quarterly Sprinkler
System Testing& | $525.00 | $2,100.00 |[$577.50 $2,310.00
Inspection - MES
9 4 uarterly Sprinkler
gstem T\;sgng &e $525.00 [$2,100.00 |¢s7750 |$2,310.00
Inspection - RDS
Total Sprinkler
Systems $2,100.00 | $8,400.00 | $2,310.00| $9,240.00
Inspection Fees
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Pricing Sheet - Table 3 — Hood Systems Inspection Company: Everon, LLC

To be completed, signed and returned with Bid.

# | Estimated Year 1 Year 1 Year 2 Year 2
Quantity Item Unit Extended Unit Extended
Price Price
10 2 | Semi-Annual
Hood Testing & $200.00 | $400.00 | $220.00 | $440.00
Inspection - MHS
11 2 | Semi-Annual
Hood Testing & $200.00 | $400.00 [$220.00 | $440.00
Inspection - MES
12 2 | Semi-Annual
Hood Testing &  |$200.00 | $400.00 [$220.00 | $440.00
Inspection - JFC
13 2 | Semi-Annual
Hood Testing & $200.00 | $400.00 |$220.00 |$440.00
Inspection - ARS
Total Hood $800.00 | $1,600.00 | $880.00 |$1,760.00
Inspection Fees
Pricing Sheet - Table 4 — Other Life Safety Inspection
# | Estimated Year1 Year 1 Year 2 Year 2
Quantity Item Unit Extended Unit Extended
Price Price
14 148 | Fire Extinguisher
Annual
. 1,036.0 8.00 .
Inspection- Unit 37.00 3 0 |$ 31,184.00
Cost
15 1 | Fire Extinguisher $7.00 $1,036.00 | $8.00 $1,184.00
Service - Cost
16 2 | FM-200 & Pre
Action System $620.00 | $620.00 | ¢700.00 | $700.00
(MES)
17 11 | Annual Hydrant
Testing & $150.00 | $1,650.00 | 316500 [ $1,815.00
Inspection
Total Other $784.00 [ $4,342.00 | $881.00 | $4,883.00
Inspections Fees
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Pricing Sheet - Table 5 -Unit Pricing — Inspections

Company: Everon, LLC

# Estimated Year1 Year 2
Annual Item Unit Price Unit Price
Quantity
18 1 | Unit Price — Annual Inspection of Included
Pull Station
19 1 | Unit Price — Annual Inspection of
Heat Detector/Smoke Detector Included
20 1 [ Unit Price — Annual Inspection of Included
Duct Detector
21 1 | Unit Price — Annual Inspect'ion of Included
Water Flow Switch/Supervisory
22 1 | Unit Price — Annual Inspection of
Bell/Horn/Horn Strobe Included
23 1 | Unit Price — Annual Inspection of Included
Main/Annunciator Panel
24 1 Quartefly Sprinkler System Included
Inspection
25 1 | Semi-Annual Hood Testing & Included
Inspection
26 2 | Semi- Annual Inspection of FM- Included
200 Pre-Action & System
27 1 | Annual Inspection of Fire Hydrant Included
28 1 | Annual Inspection Auto Paint no bid
Booth Suppression System
29 Semi-Annual Hood Cleaning no bid
30 Annual.Flre Extinguisher no bid
Inspection
31 1 | Fire Extinguisher Service - Cost Included
32 1 | Fire Extinguisher — Six Year .
. no bid
Maintenance - Cost per pound
33 1 | Hydrostatic Cylinder Testing — Dry no bid
Chemical = Unit Cost
34 1 | Hydrostatic Cylinder Testing- CO2 no bid
and Nitrogen — Unit Cost
35 60 | Hourly Rate - Craft: Fire Alarm
Service Technician $145.00 $160.00
Regular Hours: 7:00AM -3:00 PM
36 12 | Hourly Rate - Craft: Fire Alarm
Service Technician Overtime $217.50 $247.50
Hours: 3:01PM -6:59 AM
37 12,000.00 Supplies, Parts and Materials 20 % 20 %
Markup Percentage
Total Table 3
| Grand Total Tables 1,2 & 3 | $2321500 | $25437.50
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Submitted Vendor Authorized Representative:

Everon, LLC

Company Name: Dated: 5/12/25

Acknowledged and Accepted By:

L
/_%——— Title: General Manager

Signature:

Peter Delanzo
Printed Name
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